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PRODUCT INFORMATION

Model UBQ145LUX3V
Collection LuXXus
PROJECTS  PREMIUM
Width 1450 mm
Depth 470 mm
Length 1450 mm
Weight 95,6 kg
description Litres incl. 1 pers: 465

Technical information:: In 
combination with a whirlpool, for 
corner baths with panel the build-in 
height is 610 mm (measured from 
floor to underside of the bathrim).
Set of bath feet is supplied as 
standard (self-adhesive), adjustable 
from 130 à 180 mm.
Not included in scope of delivery:: 
Requires extended waste/overflow 
combination.
Diameter: 52 mm

material Quaryl®
Specification texts LuXXus; Bath; Size: 1450 x 1450 

mm; Corner; Quaryl®; Litres incl. 1 
pers: 465; Set of bath feet is 
supplied as standard (self-
adhesive), adjustable from 130 à 
180 mm.; Not included in scope of 
delivery:: Requires extended waste/
overflow combination.; Diameter: 52 
mm; Technical information:: In 
combination with a whirlpool, for 
corner baths with panel the build-in 
height is 610 mm (measured from 
floor to underside of the bathrim).
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